
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
August 13, 2013                    Condiments, Spices & Staples, RFP #132703 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An eight (8) month pricing agreement to provide condiments, spices and staple food products as 
stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  One 
hundred and nine (109) items bid; ninety-four (94) items awarded.  Items will be purchased as 
needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to lowest bidder(s) meeting 
specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  September 1, 2013 through April 30, 2014.   
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:                           ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 

 
Asian Food Solutions, Oviedo, FL     2    $     9,300.00 
Butler Foods, Pensacola, FL       5         12,300.00 
Butter Buds, Racine, WI       1              900.00 
Jennie-O Turkey Store, Willmar, MN     1         68,900.00 
JTM, Harrison, OH       1         41,500.00 
Kelley Foods, Elba, AL     14         83,300.00 
Majestic International Spice, Commerce, CA    7           6,300.00 
Michael’s Bakery, San Diego, CA     7           42,900.00 
Red Gold, Elwood, IN       1         17,700.00 
Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH      2         69,900.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL      9         38,200.00 
Father’s Table, Sanford, FL      1         18,400.00 
US Foods-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL   43       310,800.00 

   
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$720,400.00 Est. / 8 Mo.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
       

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                            Responses Received:  18          
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
August 13, 2013, 12:40PM CST  

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd   

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: July 16, 2013
BID NBR: RFP-132703
BID TITLE:  Condiments, Spices & Staples

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size 
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM Jalapeno
Sliced Rings Peppers cn Sliced Dill gl

Quantity: 300 cn 300 gl 150 cs 400 cs
0502170 0502180 0502190 0502211

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid 7.2100 No Bid 7.7425
Pensacola, FL 30.97
Churchfield Trading Co. 5.5600 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 6.2660 No Bid 7.2700 4.8750
Elba, AL 37.60 43.62 19.50
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 8.2500 No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 33.00
US Foods No Bid 7.1225 a 7.8375 a No Bid
Montgomery, AL 28.49 31.35

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

Pickles, 

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Banana Pepper Black Olives, 
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ITEM Salsa, Marinara
Relish, Sweet gl Relish, Dill gl Canned gl Sauce cn

Quantity: 50 cs 50 cs 100 cs 300 cs
0502240 0502250 0502393 0505200

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola 8.3800 8.3375 5.6833 5.3317
Pensacola, FL 33.52 33.35 34.10 31.99
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.7283 a,u
Oakland, CA 16.37 m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 5.9875 a,u 5.7200 4.7483 4.5100
Elba, AL 23.95 22.88 28.49 27.06
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid 4.0233 3.9233
Elwood, IN 24.14 23.54
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 10.1125 5.5417
Geneva, AL 40.45 p 33.25
US Foods 6.4375 a 6.1875 a 3.8983 3.8150
Montgomery, AL 25.75 24.75 23.39 22.89

Pickle Pickle
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ITEM Croutons Mayonnaise Mayonnaise Mayonnaise
Individual Individual ind Light

Quantity: 100 cs 2,000 cs 300 cs 450 cs
0505240 0507030 0507040 0507050

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.4500
Pensacola, FL 25.80
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 0.0397 a,u No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA 7.93 m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid 0.0391 a No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL 7.82 m
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0692 0.0430 5.5750 9.7225
Elba, AL 17.29 8.60 22.30 38.89
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0678 0.05125 No Bid 6.0000
Geneva, AL 16.95 10.25 24.00
US Foods 0.0675 a 0.0418 5.3075 8.3750 a
Montgomery, AL 16.88 8.35 21.23 33.50
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ITEM Mustard Mustard Barbeque Tomato
Prepared gl Prepared, Individual Sauce gl Catsup cn

Quantity: 100 cs 1,200 cs 300 cs 600 cs
0507060 0507070 0507080 0507090

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola 2.7700 No Bid 5.8000 4.2050
Pensacola, FL 11.08 23.20 25.23
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 0.0180 a,u No Bid 3.5800 a,u
Oakland, CA 3.78 m 21.48 m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid 0.0165 a,u No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL 3.29 m
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 3.2000 0.0199 8.5800 3.2000
Elba, AL 12.80 3.97 34.32 19.20
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.0550
Elwood, IN 18.33
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.9875 0.0248 9.2750 3.5250
Geneva, AL 15.95 4.95 37.10 21.15
US Foods 3.6500 0.0150 7.1225 2.8667
Montgomery, AL 14.60 2.99 a 28.49 17.20
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ITEM Vinegar Worcestershire Soy
Individual ind White Sauce Sauce gl

Quantity: 1,500 cs 200 gl 150 gl 50 cs
0507102 0507110 0507120 0507130

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.4600 a,u
Oviedo, FL 37.85 m
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.0185 1.8900 No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 18.52
Churchfield Trading Co. 0.0171 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA 17.09 m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0149 0.0000 4.8400 No Bid
Elba, AL 14.92
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold 0.0118 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN 11.76
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0181 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 18.05
US Foods 0.0133 2.5500 4.6800 m 9.5500
Montgomery, AL 13.25 38.20

Tomato Catsup
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ITEM Hot
Ranch Style pk Ranch, Individual Sauce ind

Quantity: 300 cs 3,600 cs 300 cs 600 cs
0507150 0507180 0507190 0507200

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4125 p,u
Pensacola, FL 206.25
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 0.1116 a,p,u 0.0312 a,m 0.0397 a,u
Oakland, CA 11.16 m 6.23 p,u 7.94 p,m
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0264 a,u
  BID # 2 5.28 p, u
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0245 p
Tamarac, FL 4.90 m,u
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 1.4650 0.1004 p,u 0.1292 p,u 0.0290
Elba, AL 26.37 10.04 12.92 5.80
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.3861 0.1850 p,u 0.1658 p,u 0.0323 p
Geneva, AL 24.95 11.10 9.95 6.45
US Foods 1.3361 0.0473 0.1950 p,u 0.0420 p
Montgomery, AL 24.05 9.45 11.70 8.40

Not Awarded

Reduced Fat, Individual
Salad Dressing-Dry Mix Salad Dressing Salad Dressing-Light
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ITEM Salad Dressing Salad Dressing Salad Dressing Salad Dressing
French, Individual ind Italian, Individual ind

Quantity: 600 cs 300 cs 300 cs 200 cs
0507210 0507230 0507240 0507250

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. 0.1016 a,u 0.0840 0.0342 a,u 0.0258 a,u
Oakland, CA 10.16 p,m 8.40 m,u 6.83 p,m 5.15 p,m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid 0.0877 No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL 8.77 m,u
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0700 0.0939 0.0425 0.1174
Elba, AL 13.99 9.39 8.49 11.74 p,u
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0648 0.0990 0.0440 0.0393
Geneva, AL 12.95 9.90 8.80 7.85
US Foods 0.0608 0.1220 0.0356 0.0285
Montgomery, AL 12.15 12.20 7.12 5.70

Honey Mustard, Individual Non-fat Ranch, Individual
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ITEM Salad Dressing Soy Sauce BBQ Sauce Mayonnaise
Thousand Island Individual ind Individual ind

Quantity: 200 cs 300 cs 800 cs 200 cs
0507260 0507270 0507320 0507330

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Asian Food Solutions No Bid 0.0120 No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL 5.15 m,u
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid 0.1102 No Bid
Pensacola, FL 27.56
Churchfield Trading Co. 0.0369 a,u No Bid 0.0254 0.0305 a,u
Oakland, CA 7.38 p,m 5.08 6.10 p,m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.0620 0.0290 0.0513 0.0638
Elba, AL 12.39 14.51 10.25 12.75
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid 0.0836 No Bid
Elwood, IN 20.90
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0473 0.0548 0.0995 0.0608
Geneva, AL 9.45 10.95 9.95 12.15
US Foods 0.0395 0.0474 0.0443 0.0550
Montgomery, AL 7.90 9.47 8.85 11.00

Reduced Fat, Individual

Page 8



ITEM Salsa Spaghetti Sauce Pizza Sauce
Individual ind Dip Cups Sauce cn cn

Quantity: 1,600 cs 450 cs 600 cs 200 cs
0507350 0508000 0508050 0502350

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.3660 No Bid 4.7350 5.1667
Pensacola, FL   30.74 p,u 28.41 31.00
Churchfield Trading Co. 0.0286 No Bid 2.7183 a,u 2.9250 a,u
Oakland, CA 5.71 m,u 16.31 m 17.55 m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.3122 No Bid 4.1433 4.2583
Elba, AL 18.73 24.86 25.55
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold 0.2732 p,u No Bid 3.6067 3.7633
Elwood, IN 22.95 21.64 22.58
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.0363 p,u 0.5143 4.5500 4.8250
Geneva, AL 7.25 72.00 27.30 28.95
US Foods 0.2912 0.5034 3.4933 3.6517
Montgomery, AL 17.47 70.47 20.96 21.91

Cheddar Cheese
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ITEM Onions
Pouch Individual ind lb lbs

Quantity: 100 cs 450 cs 750 cs 50 cs
0509000 0513200 0513220 0502160

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 0.1023 a,u No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA 10.23
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.7467
Tamarac, FL 41.20
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid 1.8447 a,Y No Bid
Harrison, OH 55.34 m
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.9500
Commerce, CA 29.25
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.1067 2.2204 No Bid
Elba, AL 10.67 53.29
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.0975 3.203125 No Bid
Geneva, AL 9.75 51.25
US Foods No Bid 0.0899 1.9779 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 8.99 47.47

Not Awarded

Dressing Caesar Sweet and Sour Sauce Alfredo Sauce
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ITEM Meat Base Meat Base Meat Base Egg Coloring
Beef Chicken Ham Yellow

Quantity: 200 cn 200 cn 200 cn 50 qt
0504010 0504020 0504030 0505050

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.5000
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.9900
Montgomery, AL

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded
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ITEM Coloring Coloring Cinnamon
Green Red Dark oz Ground oz

Quantity: 50 qt 50 qt 50 cn 50 cs
0505060 0505070 0510220 0510250

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid 0.3500 0.2800
Commerce, CA 5.60 4.48
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 10.7367 0.2940 0.3586
Elba, AL 64.42 4.70 5.74
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods 2.8167 a 2.4750 a 0.4389 0.3772
Montgomery, AL m 29.70 m 7.90 6.79 m

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Chili Powder
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ITEM Garlic Kitchen Oregano Paprika
Granulated oz Bouquet Ground Ground

Quantity: 300 cn 50 qt 50 cn 100 cs
0510340 0510430 0510602 0510630

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice 7.5000 No Bid 7.9500 7.9500
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 8.5900 6.9875 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid 6.3300 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL m

Page 13



ITEM Parsley Pepper, Black Pepper, Black Poultry 
Flakes Ground oz Ground, Ind oz Seasoning

Quantity: 100 cn 100 cn 100 cs 50 cs
0510660 0510690 0510721 0510750

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid 0.0029 m No Bid
Oakland, CA 8.68
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid 0.4688 No Bid 7.2500
Commerce, CA 7.50
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.5711 0.0034 No Bid
Elba, AL 10.28 10.24
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid No Bid 0.0028 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 8.30

Not Awarded
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ITEM Hot Sauce Lemon Juice Corn Starch Yeast
btl lb lb

Quantity: 50 cs 100 gl 50 cs 30 cs
0510850 0503020 0505080 0505171

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola 6.2450 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 74.94
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 1.1925 No Bid 0.7600 2.6280
Elba, AL 14.31 18.24 52.56
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods 5.0917 8.4825 0.7188 2.4330
Montgomery, AL 61.10 33.93 17.25 48.66
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ITEM Flour Flour Fettuccine Milk
All purpose Whole Wheat Noodles Non-Fat Dry

Quantity: 300 bg 30 bg 400 cs 50 cs
0505180 0505190 0505210 0505211

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 24.0000 2.5000
Geneva, AL 125.00
US Foods 20.2600 a,u 25.7600 a,u 22.4200 No Bid
Montgomery, AL

Not Awarded Not Awarded
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ITEM Graham Giant Cinnamon Fruit Hominy
Snacks Grahams Snacks          Grits     

Quantity: 125 cs 100 cs 100 cs 200 cs
0505250 0506170 0505260 0506130

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.1487 0.2900 No Bid
Elba, AL 44.61 27.84
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing 0.1125 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU 33.75 m,u
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2105 a,u No Bid No Bid 23.0000
Geneva, AL 44.20
US Foods 0.2138 No Bid 0.2688 21.4500 a,u
Montgomery, AL 44.89 25.80
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ITEM Macaroni Macaroni Macaroni Lasagna
Elbow Elbow, Whole Grain Rotinni

Quantity: 200 cs 200 cs 150 cs 75 cs
0508011 0508010 0508021 0508030

ITEM NUMBER 69a 69b 70 71
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.6570
Elba, AL 16.57
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.1500 No Bid 1.1975 1.4958
Geneva, AL 23.00 23.95 17.95
US Foods No Bid 18.1500 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
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ITEM Spaghetti Spaghetti Rice Rice
Thin Thin, Whole Grain White, Long Grain lb Brown, Long Gain

Quantity: 200 cs 200 cs 150 bg 100 cs
0508041 0508042 0508061 0508090

ITEM NUMBER 72a 72b 73 74
Asian Food Solutions No Bid 0.5340 0.7800
Oviedo, FL 26.70 m 19.50 m
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.0550 No Bid 0.5800 0.7200
Geneva, AL 21.10 29.00 18.00
US Foods No Bid 18.1500 0.7680 0.6500
Montgomery, AL 38.40 16.25
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ITEM Rice Jelly Jelly Sugar
Sticky Portion Packs Confectioners lb

Quantity: 400 bg 400 cs 50 cs 50 cs
0508100 0502200 0511050 0511121

ITEM NUMBER 75 76 77 78
Asian Food Solutions 0.8767 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL 13.15 m
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 0.0319 a,u 6.4850 a,u No Bid
Oakland, CA 6.37 m 38.91
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid 8.1817 0.9350
Elba, AL 49.09 22.44
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 8.0000 0.9583
Geneva, AL 48.00 23.00
US Foods 1.3867 No Bid No Bid 0.9108
Montgomery, AL 20.80 21.86

Not Awarded
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ITEM Sugar Sugar Soup Soup
Light Brown Granulated Cream of Chicken Cream of Mushroom

Quantity: 200 cs 200 bg 75 cs 50 cs
0511161 0511170 0512040 0512050

ITEM NUMBER 79 80 81 82
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid 21.53 a,u No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA m
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 22.4400 24.24 34.72 34.1000
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 22.1000 22.95 No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods 21.6100 22.29 31.96 31.5600
Montgomery, AL
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ITEM Snack Crackers "Moon Pie" Crackers Crackers
Cheddar Sandwich ea Captain Wafers Saltines

Quantity: 200 cs 300 cs 800 cs 800 cs
0505090 0505120 0512020 0512030

ITEM NUMBER 83 84 85 86
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.1728 0.1684 0.0316 0.0219
Elba, AL 51.85 24.25 15.80 10.94
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.1764 0.0370 0.0280
Geneva, AL 25.40 18.50 14.00
US Foods 0.1432 0.1753 0.0320 0.0215
Montgomery, AL 42.95 23.25 16.00 10.77
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ITEM Whole Wheat Pretzels Cookies
Breadstick ea Soft Jumbo Information Section Chocolate Chip

Quantity: 100 cs 300 cs Only 600 cs
0516642 0517050 0517080

ITEM NUMBER 87 88 89 90a
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. 0.1342 No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN 19.32 m
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.1367 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 19.69
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid 0.0995
San Diego, CA 19.50
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5600 0.1458
Geneva, AL No Bid 28.00 35.00
US Foods 0.1363 0.5520 0.1862
Montgomery, AL 19.63 27.60 44.69
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ITEM Cookies Cookies Cookies
Double Choc. Chunk Carnival S'mores Chocolate Chip

Quantity: 150 cs 300 cs 100 cs 600 cs
0517110 0517120 0517130 0517081

ITEM NUMBER 91a 92a 93a 90b
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products 0.0995 0.0995 0.0995 0.0995
San Diego, CA 19.50 19.50 19.50 19.50
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1458 0.14583 1.7500 No Bid
Geneva, AL 35.00 35.00 35.00
US Foods 0.1862 0.18620 0.1956 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 44.69 44.69 46.95

Cookies, Reduced Fat
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ITEM Muffin
Chocolate Chunk Carnival S'mores 100% Whole Grain ea

Quantity: 150 cs 300 cs 100 cs 3,000 cs
0517111 0517121 0517130

ITEM NUMBER 91b 92b 93b 94
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2448
Collegedale, TN 23.50 a,Y,m

Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Michael's Bakery Products 0.0995 0.0995 No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA 19.50 19.50
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2120
Cleveland, OH 19.08 m
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid No bid No Bid 0.2828
Montgomery, AL 27.15

Not Awarded

Cookies, Reduced Fat Cookies, Reduced Fat Cookies, Reduced Fat
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 Pocket Bread Biscuits Biscuits Cinnamon
Plain Frozen Whole Grain Frozen ea Sliced Bread

Quantity: 100 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 450 cs
0517100 0517300 0517290 0517200

ITEM NUMBER 95 96a 96b 97
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid 0.1014 a,u No Bid
Collegedale, TN 21.90 m
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.1039 0.1142 No Bid
Elba, AL 22.85 25.12
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4000
Cleveland, OH 28.00 p,m
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.1043 0.1155 No Bid
Geneva, AL 22.95 25.40
US Foods No Bid 0.1028 0.1130 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 22.62 24.87

Not Awarded
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ITEM Soy Milk Roll Dough Pepperoni Sliced Pepperoni
1/2 Pint Wheat ea Sliced Turkey lb

Quantity: 9,000 pt 1,200 cs 900 cs 900 cs
0540240 0517280 0512140 0512140  

ITEM NUMBER 98 99 100a 100b          N
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid 0.0627 a,u No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN 27.26 m
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Aliquippa, PA
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
The Fathers Table No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sanford, FL
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.2500 Y
Willmar, MN 76.50
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.0792 No Bid 4.7075 Y
Elba, AL 30.40 56.49
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 27.0000 No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid No Bid 24.3900 No Bid
Montgomery, AL

Not Awarded Not Awarded
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ITEM Pan/Food Spray Godita Bread
cn Whole Grain

Quantity: 300 cs 800 cs
0502100 0517330

ITEM NUMBER 101 102
Asian Food Solutions No Bid No Bid
Oviedo, FL
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid
Collegedale, TN
Beaver Valley Baking No Bid 0.1700
Aliquippa, PA 24.48 m
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Churchfield Trading Co. No Bid No Bid
Oakland, CA
Butter Buds 2.9783 No Bid
Racine, WI 17.87 m
The Fathers Table No Bid 0.1597
Sanford, FL 23.00 m
Jennie-O Turkey Store No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
JTM Provisions Company No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Majestic International Spice No Bid No Bid
Commerce, CA
Kelley Foods of Alabama 3.3317 No Bid
Elba, AL 19.99 Y
Michael's Bakery Products No Bid No Bid
San Diego, CA
MJM Marketing No Bid No Bid
Kailua Kona, HIU
Red Gold No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Super Bakery No Bid No Bid
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods 3.3583 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 20.15

a = Alternate
m = Minimum order requirement by vendor
p = Pack Size unacceptable
Y = Alternate product bid, sample sent by vendor and tested.  Product was approved in taste tests.
u = Vendor did not send sample, product does not meet specifications, or product was not approved in taste test.
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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